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COUNSELING SERVICE 

The Philosophical Research Society 
and its School recognize philosoph­
ical, religious, and psychological 
counseling as an integral part of an 
idealistic educational program. The 
integration and unfoldment of the 
internal life of the individual not 
only assists him in the solution of 
his personal problems, but makes 
possible a broader and deeper ao­
plication of knowledge on all levels 
of activity. 

Growth is a constant challenP,"e 
demanding ever more insight into 
the workings of the psychic life. 
Timely counseling is a personal ex­
perience of the greatest value. 

Through counseling, the indi­
vidual is helped to sustain his inte­
gration under the stress of modern 
living, avert many critical situa­
tions, correct unfortunate tenden­
cies, and come to a better and 
richer understanding of the laws 
operating beneath the surface of 
man's mental and emotional con­
duct patterns. 

TO MEET A REAL NEED 

Because of the unique place our 
Society occupies in the sphere of 
learning, many of our students and 
friends have appealed to us for 
psychological direction, guidance, 
analysis, and therapy. Due to lack 
of adequate facilities, it has not been 
possible to serve effectively the ever 
increasing number of those who 
desire counseling. 

The Society has therefore decided 
to establish a Counseling Center 
and placed it under the direction of 
Mr. Henry L. Drake, who is trained 
in both psychology and philosophy. 
H is approach to counseling and a­
nalysis will be in conformity with 
the basic philosophic al, religious, 
and psychological convictions of the 
Society. 

As our Society is a non-profit educa­
tional corporation, this Counseling 
Service can be offered at a substan­
tially lower fee than would be pos­
sible in private practice. Those in­
terested in such services for them-



selves, members of their families, or 
their friends should call NOrmandy 
3-2167 and ask for Mr. Drake, 
Director of Counseling Service. 

"Of all things which 

a man has, next to the 

gods, his soul is most 

divine and most truly 

his own." 
PLATO 


